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Letters to the Editor
Schnitzler’s syndrome with 
biclonal gammopathy 
successfully treated with 
hydroxychloroquine and 
low dose steroids

Sirs,
Schnitzler’s syndrome is a rare condition 
with chronic urticarial rash and mono-
clonal IgM gammopathy, accompanied by 
at least two of the following: intermittent 
unexplained fever, arthralgia/arthritis, bone 
pain, lymphadenopathy, hepato-splenom-
egaly, acute phase response and abnormal 
findings on bone investigations (1). Since 
1972 (2), about 90 cases have been report-
ed, the majority of which are long-stand-
ing; however, about 15% of patients will 
develop lymphoproliferative disorders (1, 
3). The pathophysiology of the disease still 
remains unclear, although autoantibody-
mediated mechanisms have been proposed. 
Treatment is often disappointing even if 
there have been promising developments 
with anakinra, an analogue of interleukin-1 
receptor antagonist (4). We report a further 
case of Schnitzler’s syndrome first treated 
with cyclosporine, then with hydroxychlo-
roquine and steroids, who presented a good 
outcome still persisting after a 30-month 
follow-up. 
A 63-year-old Italian male came to our di-
vision in June 2003. Because of a history 
of urticaria and arthralgia, he had received 
steroids, anti-histamines and non-steroidal 
anti-inflammatory drugs (NSAIDs) with 
short-term efficacy. Laboratory investiga-
tions revealed an erythrocyte sedimentation 
rate (ESR) of 41 mm/h, C-reactive protein 
(CRP) level of 27 mg/L and serum IgM of 
830 mg/dL; autoantibody screening was 
negative. Serum protein electrophoresis 
demonstrated two monoclonal IgM compo-
nents with lambda (0.17 g/dL) and kappa 
(0.07 g/dL) light chains on immunofixation. 
Physical examination showed red non-pru-
ritic diffuse papules without fever detection 
A cutaneous biopsy revealed neutrophilic 
hypocomplementemic urticaria. Therefore, 
on the basis of the combination of neu-
trophilic urticaria, clonal IgM gammopa-
thy, arthralgia and acute phase response, a 
Schnitzler’s syndrome diagnosis has been 
formulated. Cyclosporine 3 mg/kg daily 
plus prednisone 50 mg weekly were then 
administered with initial improvement, fol-
lowed by relapse of symptoms. 
In July 2004 a lymph-node ultrasonography 
documented bilateral presence of multiple 
lymphadenopathies; ESR and CRP levels 
were elevated, serum IgM reached 1450 
mg/dL, monoclonal IgM-λ increased to 

1 g/dL and IgM-κ was 0,18 g/dL (Fig. 1). 
Bone marrow examination and lymphnode 
biopsy excluded a lymphoproliferative ev-
olution. Hydroxychloroquine 400 mg daily 
was started in addition to prednisone 50 mg 
weekly. After two months, a progressive 
resolution of urticaria and arthralgias with 
ESR (32 mm/h) and CRP (5 mg/L) reduc-
tion, permitted us to taper the prednisone to 
a 30 mg-dose weekly. In the last 30 months 
the patient has been experiencing an almost 
complete symptom control excluding rare 
episodes of acute arthralgia; serum mono-
clonal IgM-λ and κ remained stable.
Whereas most patients with this syndrome 
reported having monoclonal IgM parapro-
tein associated with kappa light chain (1), 
this patient belongs to an extremely rare 
variant with biclonal IgM gammopathy and 
prevalence of lambda light chains. To our 
knowledge, only another patient with bi-
clonal gammopathy has been described (5). 
Treatment of Schnitzler’s syndrome remains 
a challenge, NSAIDs, anti-histamines, ster-
oids are reported as first-line therapy (6). 
In this patient initial treatment with these 
drugs obtained only partial control of skin 
rash and subsequent administration of cy-
closporine was unable to reach satisfactory 
results. Because of the disabling arthralgia 
and persisting skin lesions as well as the 
unknown safety profile about malignancies 
induction by the use of anakinra, it was de-
cided to start hydroxychloroquine, which 
was inconstantly described as an effective 
treatment of this syndrome (1, 7, 8). Hy-
droxychloroquine with low dose steroids 
promptly improved urticarial lesions and 
arthralgias, leading to progressive resolu-
tion; moreover it stabilized the biclonal 
IgM components and serum IgM level. The 
benefit induced by treatment was immedi-
ate and still persists after 30 months. It may 

be hypothesised that hydroxychloroquine 
efficacy in this patient, could be the conse-
quence of direct action of antimalarials on 
macrophages, inhibiting production of in-
flammation mediators such as interleukin-1 
and interleukin-6 (9). 
We believe that this case may be of interest 
not only for the unusual presentation of a 
biclonal gammopathy, but also for the ex-
cellent response to a combination therapy 
with hydroxychloroquine and low dose 
steroids. 
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Fig. 1. Serum protein electrophoresis showing two 
monoclonal IgM components, n° 1 and n° 2 correspond 
to lambda and kappa light chains respectively on the  
immunofixation.
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