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Letters to the Editors
Biopsy-proven giant cell arteritis 
patients with coronary artery 
disease have increased risk of 
aortic aneurysmal disease and 
arterial thrombosis

Sirs,
Due to the progressive aging of the Euro-
pean population, giant cell arteritis (GCA) 
has emerged as a relevant disease in our 
daily clinical practice (1). However, con-
troversies on whether GCA is associated 
with increased mortality are still present. In 
this regard, Talarico et al. have recently as-
sessed the mortality of GCA in a series of 
112 biopsy-proven patients diagnosed be-
tween 1990 and 2010 in Pisa (2). In keeping 
with population-based studies from North-
ern and Southern Europe (3, 4), GCA in 
Pisa was not associated with increased rate 
of mortality.
There are, however, important unanswered 
aspects that may influence the mortality 
of GCA. In spite of being vertebrobasilar 
stroke more common in biopsy-proven GCA 
patients than in individuals of the same age 
and sex (5, 6), as elegantly pointed out by 
Pipitone et al., mortality rates of GCA are 
generally comparable to those of the general 
population (7). Nevertheless, when we spe-
cifically assessed the incidence of ischae-
mic heart-coronary artery disease (IHD) in 
a series of 210 biopsy-proven GCA patients 
diagnosed in the Lugo region of Northwest 
Spain between 1981 and 2001, we observed 
that the standardised mortality ratio due to 
IHD using the Spanish population 50 years 
and older as a reference was slightly in-
creased (1.62 [95% confidence interval- CI 
0.70–3.20]) (8). Mortality in patients with 
GCA who had IHD was higher than that 
observed in patients without IHD [crude 
hazard ratio 3.42 (95% CI 1.85–6.33), 
p<0.001; age and sex adjusted hazard ratio 
2.81 (95% CI 1.51–5.21), p=0.001] (8). In a 
subsequent study, we confirmed that aortic 
aneurysmal disease may be observed in the 
follow-up of Lugo individuals that had pre-
viously been diagnosed with biopsy-proven 
GCA (9). 
Taking those results  together, we have as-
sessed whether the frequency of large-ves-
sel involvement, defined as aortic aneurys-

mal disease and/or arterial thrombosis, was 
increased in biopsy-proven GCA patients 
who had suffered IHD. For this purpose we 
assessed data of 255 biopsy-proven GCA 
patients diagnosed between 1981 and 2005 
in Northwest Spain that were followed until 
death or September 2006 (10). We did not 
observe increased risk of cancer in this se-
ries (10). However, a reappraisal of follow-
up data of this cohort allowed disclosing in-
creased risk of aortic aneurysmal disease or 
arterial thrombosis in those with had expe-
rienced IHD. With respect to this, IHD be-
fore or after the diagnosis of GCA occurred 
in 22 (8.6%) of the 255 biopsy-proven GCA 
patients. Interestingly, 7 (31.8%) of the 22 
patients with IHD developed subsequently 
aortic aneurysmal disease or arterial throm-
bosis. In contrast, aortic aneurysmal disease 
or arterial thrombosis was only observed in 
25 (10.7%) of 233 without IHD. Therefore, 
the risk of large-vessel involvement in bi-
opsy-proven GCA patients with IHD from 
Northwest Spain was almost 4 times in-
creased when compared with those without 
IHD (odds ratio 3.88 [95% CI: 1.49- 10.21]; 
p=0.004). 
One of the main limitations of the epide-
miological studies on GCA is the relatively 
small size of the series. Therefore, our re-
sults should be confirmed by other groups. 
Although we are also aware of the impor-
tant influence of traditional cardiovascular 
risk factors in the risk of vascular complica-
tions of GCA (5, 9, 11), our findings indi-
cate that biopsy-proven GCA patients with 
a history of coronary artery disease should 
be monitored for the existence of large-ves-
sel involvement, in particular if hyperten-
sion is present at the time of diagnosis of 
GCA (5, 9, 11).
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